
 

 

 

  

Saudi Aramco: Company General Use 

TERMS OF USE  

SAUDI ARAMCO ENTERPRISE PROJECT MANAGEMENT (EPM) MOBILE APPLICATION  

Legal notice 

Saudi Arabian Oil Company (“Saudi Aramco”), is a Saudi joint stock company established in the Kingdom of 
Saudi Arabia by virtue of Royal Decree No. M/8, dated 4/4/1409H (corresponding 13/11/1988G) with fully 
paid capital of SAR 60,000,000,000 and registered in the city of Dhahran under commercial registration no 
2052101150.  

Saudi Aramco owns and operates this mobile app and related websites (together “App”). Before using our 
App, please read these terms carefully. 

By using this App, you signify your agreement to these Terms of Use. If you do not agree to these Terms of 
Use, please do not use this App. This includes downloading and installing on your device. Saudi Aramco 
may modify these terms of use, as it deems necessary, at any time and without notice. 

Privacy and personal data 

We take usage of personal data very seriously.  We understand that you will want to know how we use your 
personal data.  This App’s privacy notice sets out information about how we use your personal data.  This 
may be updated from time to time and we would recommend you review this regularly and in the event of 
any changes.   

Disclaimer 

The materials in this App are provided "as is" and without warranties of any kind, either express or implied. 
To the fullest extent permissible pursuant to applicable law, Saudi Aramco disclaims all warranties, express 
or implied, including, but not limited to, implied warranties of merchantability and fitness for a particular 
purpose. 

Saudi Aramco does not warrant that the functions contained in the materials will be uninterrupted or error-
free, that defects will be corrected, or that this App is free of viruses or other harmful components. 

Saudi Aramco does not warrant or make any representations regarding the use or the results of the use of 
the materials in this App in terms of their correctness, accuracy, reliability, or otherwise. You (and not Saudi 
Aramco) assume the entire cost of all necessary servicing, repair or correction. Neither Saudi Aramco nor 
any of its affiliates shall be liable for any direct, indirect, incidental, consequential, or punitive damages 
arising out of or in any way connected with accessing or using any content on this App or any content on 
any website or websites linked to this App (including but not limited to, the Site). 

Saudi Aramco reserves the right to make changes to this App and to the representations included as part 
of the App at any time without notice. 

Ownership of the copyright of this App 

https://saapplicationsportal.com/privacy/myit_privacy_notice.pdf
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All copyright in the text, graphics, user interfaces, visual interfaces, photographs, trademarks, logos, 
sounds, music, artwork, any downloads and software code (collectively, "Content"), including but not 
limited to the design, structure, selection, coordination, expression, "look and feel" and arrangement of 
such Content, contained on the App is owned, controlled or licensed by or to Saudi Aramco or its 
subsidiaries, and is protected by trade dress, copyright, patent and trademark laws, and various other 
intellectual property rights and unfair competition laws.  All rights reserved. 

Except as expressly provided in these Terms of Use, no part of the App and no Content may be copied, 
reproduced, republished, uploaded, posted, publicly displayed, encoded, translated, transmitted or 
distributed in any way (including "mirroring") to any other computer, server, website or other medium for 
publication or distribution or for any commercial enterprise, without Saudi Aramco’s express prior written 
consent. 

You may use information on Saudi Aramco products and services (such as data sheets, knowledge base 
articles, and similar materials) purposely made available by Saudi Aramco for downloading from the App, 
provided that you (1) not remove any proprietary notice language in all copies of such documents, (2) use 
such information only for your personal, non-commercial informational purpose and do not copy or post 
such information on any networked computer or broadcast it in any media (unless otherwise stated 
explicitly on the App), (3) make no modifications to any such information, and (4) not make any additional 
representations or warranties relating to such documents. 

Ownership of trademarks 

ARAMCO, SAUDI ARAMCO, the ENERGY BURST logo, and WHERE ENERGY IS OPPORTUNITY are 
trademarks of Saudi Arabian Oil Company. 

Changes 

We may make changes to these Terms of Use from time to time.  These will be made here and we’d 
recommend you take a look from time to time.    

These Terms of Use were last modified on: 27 July 2021 

Applicable law 

The Kingdom of Saudi Arabia shall have non-exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of your use 
of this service.  Saudi Aramco reserves the right to bring proceedings to the courts of the country of your 
location. 

In the event that any or any part of the terms contained in these terms of use shall be determined by any 
competent authority to be invalid, unlawful or unenforceable to any extent, such term shall to that extent 
be severed from the remaining terms which shall continue to be valid and enforceable to the fullest extent 
permitted by law.  

 


